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At present, three international conventions (one of which has been modified by many signatory states to
produce a fourth regime), together with certain pre-existing national regimes, provide this entitlement to
limit most types of private law liability arising in the ordinary course of the shipowner's activities. Limitation
may be invoked by the shipowner in two principal ways: by way of a defence, or by commencing a
limitation action, which latter normally involves constituting a limitation fund. Whether the shipowner
should take the initiative and start a limitation action, or whether he or she should wait and use limitation as a
defense, will depend on the choice of fora available. Significant differences among jurisdictions inevitably
give rise to forum-shopping.

In the course of this book's practical explanation and discussion of shipowners' rights to limit their liability,
the authors consider how the conflict of laws rules of various jurisdictions might be used by parties in
international commerce to raise the most advantageous defense or select the most suitable tribunal to
commence a limitation action. For each potentially applicable limitation regime, the book identifies the
amount to which liability is limited and the tests that apply when a claimant wishes to challenge a
shipowner's right to limit liability.

Among the issues brought to the fore are the following:

right to the lowest limit versus the strongest protection of the right to limit;●

circumstances under which the ship against which the action is brought may be arrested and sold;●

when the shipowner's right to limit can be challenged and denied;●

action in rem for collisions;●

freezing injunctions; and ;●

direct action against an insurer.●

The book also discusses various specific liability regimes that address damage suffered by passengers,
damage to cargo interests, oil pollution damage from tankers, damage from bunker oil from non tankers, and
damage caused by hazardous and noxious cargoes.

As an in-depth exploration and analysis of the differences between the various limitation regimes that
provide shipowners with a global entitlement to limit liability--and the broader legal issues such limitation
rights gives rise to--this book will prove invaluable to any party involved in shipping disputes. Lawyers
representing either shipowners (and other parties with an interest in the ship's operations) or claimants will
clearly identify the major issues related to the selection of the appropriate forum for the limitation of
liability, including procedural details.
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From reader reviews:

Dominique Fletcher:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Shipowners' Global Limitation of Liability and
the Conflict of Laws: International l Regimes and Issues in Forum-Shopping will make you to possibly be
smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that open or
reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you
seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Robert Stratton:

This book untitled Shipowners' Global Limitation of Liability and the Conflict of Laws: International l
Regimes and Issues in Forum-Shopping to be one of several books that will best seller in this year, honestly,
that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this
particular book in the book retail store or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So
there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Otis Kozlowski:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
was exactly added. This book Shipowners' Global Limitation of Liability and the Conflict of Laws:
International l Regimes and Issues in Forum-Shopping was filled with regards to science. Spend your extra
time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when
they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a
guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book you wanted.

Michael Martin:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named of book
Shipowners' Global Limitation of Liability and the Conflict of Laws: International l Regimes and Issues in
Forum-Shopping. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add
your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about reserve.
It can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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