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In August 1831, in Southampton County, Virginia, Nat Turner led a bloody uprising that took the lives of
some fifty-five white people—men, women, and children—shocking the South. Nearly as many black
people, all told, perished in the rebellion and its aftermath. Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton
County presents important new evidence about the violence and the community in which it took place,
shedding light on the insurgents and victims and reinterpreting the most important account of that event, The
Confessions of Nat Turner. Drawing upon largely untapped sources, David F. Allmendinger Jr. reconstructs
the lives of key individuals who were drawn into the uprising and shows how the history of certain white
families and their slaves—reaching back into the eighteenth century—shaped the course of the rebellion.

Never before has anyone so patiently examined the extensive private and public sources relating to
Southampton as does Allmendinger in this remarkable work. He argues that the plan of rebellion originated
in the mind of a single individual, Nat Turner, who concluded between 1822 and 1826 that his own masters
intended to continue holding slaves into the next generation. Turner specifically chose to attack households
to which he and his followers had connections. The book also offers a close analysis of his Confessions and
the influence of Thomas R. Gray, who wrote down the original text in November 1831. The author draws
new conclusions about Turner and Gray, their different motives, the authenticity of the confession, and the
introduction of terror as a tactic, both in the rebellion and in its most revealing document.

Students of slavery, the Old South, and African American history will find in Nat Turner and the Rising in
Southampton County an outstanding example of painstaking research and imaginative family and community
history.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Mazzariello:

The book Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton County can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book Nat
Turner and the Rising in Southampton County? A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one
aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer using your
book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to share all of
these. Book Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton County has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it
has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it
is very wonderful.

Robert Stratton:

Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton County can be one of your basic books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this e-book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to
place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton County
nevertheless doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource
details that maybe you can be one of it. This great information may drawn you into brand new stage of
crucial considering.

John McCraw:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by examining a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Nat Turner and the Rising in
Southampton County which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.

Cassandra Giron:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will
get it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Nat Turner and the Rising in Southampton County can
give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have point that they don't
and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get
success. This e-book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than
different make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have Nat Turner and the Rising in
Southampton County.
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